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Geneglace F600 (x3) ice plant

  

Specifications

Brand Geneglace

Type F600 (x3) ice plant

Capacity 42.000 kg/24hr

Refrigerant Freon (R449a)

Remarks Y.o.b. 2015

Stock 1

  

  

Description 

Used Geneglace F600 (x3) ice plant

Well maintained Geneglace F600 (x3)
complete flake ice plant on Freon
R449a installed in one container. This
flake ice set comes with a Bitzer
HSN8591-160-40P screw compressor
with a brazed heat exchanger as
economizer, 1 GEA F600 SBF water-
cooled condenser, oil cooler as
evaporator, 3 Geneglace ice makers,
Hermetic CNF 32-160 liquid pump and
a Provides oil separator. Further the set
comes with a KTI CSP-100-50 Hz –
R449a-ct-GG control cabinet and
control panel.

Each Geneglace F600 unit makes
between 10.000 and 14.000 kg/24h of
flake ice out of fresh water. Please feel
free to contact us for more information!
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*Why choose for HOSBV? Were not only
the largest used refrigeration specialist
in Europe, but also, we deliver all
equipment including an extensive test,
warranty and industrial cleaning. *If
requested we are happy to arrange
your logistics. 
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